
BUYER / DATE

No. Description Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1

White Traffic Paint                
Product Manufacturer & 
Product Code:____________  
(All item numbers must meet or 
exceed specifications listed in this bid 
proposal, NO EXCEPTIONS) 18,000 Gallon

6.74 121,320.00 7.00 126,000.00 7.11 127,980.00 NO BID NO BID

2

Yellow Traffic Paint             
Product Manufacturer & 
Product Code: ____________  
(All item numbers must meet or 
exceed specifications listed in this bid 
proposal, NO EXCEPTIONS) 22,000 Gallon

6.74 148,280.00 7.00 154,000.00 7.21 158,620.00

269,600.00 280,000.00 286,600.00

22,107.20 22,960.00 23,501.20

291,707.20 302,960.00 310,101.20

1

Hi-Build White Traffic Paint     
Product Manufacturer and 
Product Code: ____________  
(All item numbers must meet or 
exceed specifications listed in this bid 
proposal, NO EXCEPTIONS) 250 Gallon

9.96 2,490.00 10.00 2,500.00 9.13 2,282.50 NO BID NO BID

Fast Dry Waterborne Traffic Paint 250 Gallon Containers

                     
Alpine Products Inc

Schedule I  

Vendor Name
                     

Ennis Paint

Vendor Name
AWARD AND REASON THEREFORE:

Subtotal Schedule I:

Tax @ 8.2%:  
Tax is Destination Based in Washington State

Grand Total Schedule I:

Hi-Build Traffic Paint 250 Gallon Containers

                     
Pervo Paint Co

                     
EZ-Liner 

Vendor Name
                     

Vulcan Signs

Bid Tabulation

Project No.:  C11009
Contract Term:  1 Yr. w/ 4 - 1 yr extenstions
Project Manager: Dave Veley/ Equipment Services

Project:  Waterborne Traffic Marking Paint
Bid Opening:  April 15, 2010 @ 10 am

Vendor NameVendor Name

Contract Term:  05/05/2010 to 05/05/2015

Optional Schedule II 



                     
Alpine Products Inc

Vendor Name
                     

Ennis Paint

Vendor Name
                     

Pervo Paint Co
                     

EZ-Liner 

Vendor Name
                     

Vulcan Signs

Vendor NameVendor Name

2

Hi-Build Yellow Traffic Paint  
Product Manufacturer & 
Product Code ____________  
(All item numbers must meet or 
exceed specifications listed in this bid 
proposal, NO EXCEPTIONS) 250 Gallon

9.96 2,490.00 10.00 2,500.00 8.69 2,172.50

4,980.00 5,000.00 4,455.00

408.36 410.00 365.31

5,388.36 5,410.00 4,820.31

1

Low Temp White Traffic Paint 
Product Manufacturer & 
Product Code: ____________ 
(All item numbers must meet or 
exceed specifications listed in this bid 
proposal, NO EXCEPTIONS) 250 Gallon

8.73 2,182.50 8.80 2,200.00 9.65 2,412.50 NO BID NO BID

2

Low Temp Yellow Traffic Paint  
Product Manufacturer & 
Product Code ____________  
(All item numbers must meet or 
exceed specifications listed in this bid 
proposal, NO EXCEPTIONS) 250 Gallon

8.73 2,182.50 8.80 2,200.00 9.28 2,320.00

4,365.00 4,400.00 4,732.50

357.93 360.80 388.07

4,722.93 4,760.80 5,120.57

Delivery:
FOB Yakima County Shop, 1216 S 18th Street, Yakima, WA  98901
Each order will be delivered within 14 working days from receipt of each order (ARO) and at prices and terms specified unless 
otherwise noted.

MUST BE INCLUDED:  

Grand Total Optional Schedule II:

Optional Schedule III 

Freight:

Subtotal Optional Schedule III:

Tax @ 8.2%:  
Tax is Destination Based in Washington State

Grand Total Optional Schedule III:

Low Temperature Waterborne Traffic Paint 250 Gallon Containers

Subtotal Optional Schedule II:

Tax @ 8.2%:  
Tax is Destination Based in Washington State


