
BID 

#:

PRE-

QUAL.

10% 

BID 

BID 

ALTERNATE

1 YES YES

2 YES NO

3 YES YES

4 YES YES X 154,070.00$    

5 YES YES

6 YES YES X 6,312.00$        

7 YES YES X 8,500.00$        

8 YES YES X 9,700.00$        

9 NO NO

10 NO YES

11 NO YES

12 YES YES X 24,286.00$      

13 YES YES

14 YES YES

15 YES YES X 16,500.00$      

16 YES YES

17 YES YES X 15,000.00$      

18 YES YES X 10,574.00$      

19 YES YES X 7,400.00$        

20 NO YES

21 NO NO

22 YES YES X 19,970.00$      

23 YES YES

24 NO YES

25 YES YES X 22,450.00$      

26 YES YES X 22,609.00$      

27 NO YES

BID TAB RESULTS AS WERE RECEIVED AT THE BID OPENING ON FEBRUARY 26, 2009

MSB BUILDING - 1ST FLOOR CONFERENCE ROOM #130 @ 1:30 PM

CITY OF CLEARWATER 

WICHMAN CONSTRUCTION

513,411.80$            

                       TABULATION OF BIDS:    FIRE STATION #48 RENOVATIONS (07-0052-FI)               

BID OPENING: THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 26, 2009      AWARD DATE: THURSDAY, MARCH 19, 2009

CONTRACTOR
PRE-BID 

2/3/09 BID TOTAL

AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION SERVICES NO BID

ANGLE & SCHMID

BOLLENBACK BUILDERS, INC. NO BID

CAIRNS CORPORATION        APPARENT LOW $391,970.70

CUSTOM CONTRACTORS LLC

E. O. KOCH CONSTRUCTION

ENERGY SERVICES & PRODUCTS CORP.

EVELAND BROTHERS, INC.

KHORS CONSTRUCTION, INC.

FIELDS CONSTRUCTION

FROGWATER ENTERPRISES, INC.

HODGE MANAGEMENT

KIMMINS CONTRACTING CORP.

KLOOTE CONTRACTING, INC

KWM CONSTRUCTION LLC

MLB CONSTRUCTION SERVICES

PROEFKE CONSTRUCTION

R. KRUEGER CONSTRUCTION INC.

RAUH-CO CONSTRUCTION SERVICES   3RD LOW

RESTORATION CONSTRUCTION TEAM

NO BID

565,273.00$            

501,500.00$            

495,682.00$            

530,110.90$            

NO BID

NO BID

624,195.00$            

NO BID

579,981.60$            

469,260.00$            

465,740.00$            

447,535.00$            

NO BID

STAMPER CONSTRUCTION CO

THE TERBO GROUP

SCOTTO PLUMBING SERVICE

570,900.00$            

SILVERKING CONTRACTING, INC.     2ND LOW

SOUTHSHORE DEVELOPMENT & CONSTRUCTION

SOUTHERN BUILDING SERVICES


