
 

 

Pledge Form 

First Congregational Church (UCC) of Oroville 

2016-2017 

 

Our ANNUAL BUDGET time is here. In order to create our budget we 
need to estimate how much money we can reasonably count on for the 
coming year. 
 

Your assistance in filling out the form on the reverse side will be greatly 
appreciated. 
 

The church is a fellowship of people who give and combine their offer-
ings in order to accomplish the faithful work that none of us can do 
alone. That is why your pledge is so important to the life and work of 
this fellowship we share. The information that you provide will help us 
determine what we can do as a church in the coming year. 
 

Only our Financial Secretary will see your pledge form, and your infor-
mation will be treated as confidential. A summary report showing totals 
only, will be prepared for the congregation. 
 

A blank copy of your pledge form is included for your own personal 
records. 
 

Your pledge is a faith promise; it does not create a legal obligation. If 
during the coming year it should become necessary to reduce your giv-
ing or if you decide to increase your giving, please contact our Financial 
Secretary, Eleanor Pontius, at 530-589-0686. 
 

Thank you for your faithful and generous support of the ministry we 
share at First Congregational Church (UCC) of Oroville. 
 

 

Thank you for trusting, caring, and giving together. May God bless you. 



 

 
 

Please Retain This Copy for Your Records 

 

First Congregational Church (UCC) of Oroville 

          Record of Pledges – 2016-2017 

 

My pledges for June 2016 to May 2017. 
 

1. For the General Budget  
 of the church, I have promised to give… 

  

 [  ]                           per month  or  [  ]                           per week    
 

2. For Organ Maintenance, I promise to give 

 

 [  ]                           per month  or  [  ]                           per week    
 

 

3. For the Church Grounds Maintenance, I promise to give 

 

 [  ]                            per month  or  [  ]                           per week    
 

 

4.  For Our Church’s Wider Mission 

 (to send on to our Northern California-Nevada Conference 

 of the United Church of Christ), I have promised to give… 

 

 [  ]                            per month  or  [  ]                           per week   
 

 

 

Your Signature                                                                   Date  

Pledge Card – 2016-2017 

First Congregational Church of Oroville (UCC) 
 

Please return this card as soon as possible to the offering plate during 
worship, or mail to our Financial Secretary: 
 Eleanor Pontius 

 6277 Woodman Drive 

 Oroville, CA  95966-3845 
 

For June 2016 to May 2017, for the General Budget of the church, I prom-
ise to give… 
 

 [  ]                                        per month  or  
  

 [  ]                                        per week  
   

For June 2016 to May 2017, for Organ Maintenance, I promise to give… 
 

 [  ]                                        per month or 
   

 [  ]                                        per week 
 

For June 2016 to May 2017, for Gardening Fund for church grounds,  
I promise to give… 
 

 [  ]                                        per month or 
 

 [  ]                                        per week 
 

For June to May, for the Our Church’s Wider Mission (to send on to our 
Northern California-Nevada Conference of the United Church of Christ), I 
promise to give… 
 

   [  ]                                        per month  or  
  

 [  ]                                        per week  
   

In addition to the above, I am enclosing with this form a one time special 
gift of… 
 

 [  ]                                        for the General Budget of the church. 
 

 [  ]                                        for Church Grounds Maintenance 
 

 [  ]                                        for Organ Maintenance 
 

 [  ]                                        for other area of interest 
 
 

Your Signature                                                                Date                               


