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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form YES YES YES YES NO BID YES YES YES

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES NOT SIGNED YES NO BID YES YES YES

PRICE SHEET REFERENCE   

#75130 B05    

ACCOUNT     

#231640003

REFERENCE   

#H139094

REFERENCE   

#100074924

1.  Audiometer, AC Model, Screening 

And Threshold, Full Range of 

Frequencies And Intensity Levels, 

Welch Allyn #232 Or Equal (Zenith High)

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

NO BID NO BID NO BID
AS   #23200  

891.00
NO BID

AS  #23200  

(5660782)   

958.67

NO BID
AS  #23200   

948.00

2. Blood Pressure Monitor, Digital, 

Manual Inflating, 16mm Digital Display, 

Audible Tone Indicates Proper Inflation 

Level, Medium Cuff, Instruction Guide, 

With Case A & D Engineering, Inc. #UA-

702H Or Equal                                            

(1 for Bellalago Middle)                             

(1 for Zenith High)                                      

Estimated Quantities-2                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

AS           

#A18-UA702H  

27.50

OFFER  

#NC9030862  

(NOT DIGITAL) 

125.80

OMRON       

#11-200       

ADULT 

ANALOG      

#91069        

11.96

AMERICAN  

DIAG.  

#ADC6012    

23.00

NO BID

OMRON       

#HEM-432C  

(4982512)     

25.36

OMRON       

#HEM-432CN  

(72396)        

38.20

NO BID

3. Dispenser, Alcohol, 8 oz, Plastic, 

Push Top                                                    

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

GRAFCO      

#G24-1533     

5.95

OFFER  

#NC9018225   

9.93

#40518  

BROWN 

IMPRINTED  

6.50

GRAHAM 

FIELD        

#GF38-1533-1  

5.50

NO BID

TECH-MED  

#35602   

(4071516)    

5.38

(34026M)   6.75

GRAHAM 

FIELD  

#28675015331  

6.00
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NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS
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4.  Eye Test Cabinet, Illuminated,     

Durable metal, 2 non-glare Translucent 

eye charts:  Standard    Snell And 

Illiterate "E" type,                                       

Includes Standard 8W Fluorescent          

Daylight Bulb, Portable Or Permanent 

Mount, 11"x22"                                          

To Include Standard Snell                        

Red And Green Charts Snell or Equal     

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______                                        

NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRAHAM 

FIELD  

#GF1258    

260.00

NO BID

TECH-MED  

#3050   

(1004836)    

4.47

NO BID

GRAHAM 

FIELD  #1258   

276.00

5.  First Aid Kit, 25 Person, Rust      

Resistant 24 Gauge Steel Case, List Of 

Contents Are To Be Included With Bid,   

Johnson & Johnson Or Equal                  

(Zenith High)                                         

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

SWIFT        

#S60-34-25EF  

14.50

#S47527-1    

16.26
NO BID

ABCO  

#AB059067    

16.00

NO BID

HEALER  

#2025G  

(1307428)    

15.62

(53503M)     

29.70

#1799-25   

20.00

6.  Magnifying Lamp, Clear                

Magnified Illuminated View,                      

5" Double Convex, Clear Optical Glass, 

3-Diopter Lens, 22 Watt                             

Fluorescent Bulb, 1.75X                            

Magnification, 41" Arm, With             

Caster Base, White                                    

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

NO BID

OFFER        

#12-071-G   

11.36

NO BID

BURTON  

#BRT0184040  

527.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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HEALTH SUPPLIES & EQUIP FOR 

NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

7.  Narcotic Cabinet, Single Door,   

Double Lock, 30"W x 30"Hx12"D             

18 Gauge Steel Exterior, 1 Fixed       

Shelf, 1 Adjustable Shelf, Includes   

Mounting Hardware, White or Beige        

(Zenith High)                                       

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

NO BID

OFFER        

#1G-121-871   

12.5X 36X 72   

2,186.07

NO BID

HEALTH CARE 

LOG.  

#MSC3730     

320.00

NO BID

LAKESIDE  

#3901M-2   

(1201158)   

24WX10DX30H 

187.24

NO BID
#30262730BG  

174.00

8. Panels, Privacy, mobile, each panel 

27" W, 3-panels, folding, 1" round 

tubular steel frame, flame-retardant, 

bacteriastatic, white vinyl, has four 2" 

twin-wheel casters, 69" H                 

Estimated Quantities-2                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

WINCO  #313   

107.90
NO BID NO BID

WINCO  

#WIN313    

120.00

NO BID

WINCO  

#31309   

(1200545)    

109.76

(18736)    

118.95

#6900-313    

120.00

9.  Recovery Couches, With Base,   

Adjustable Back Rest, Paper Roll     

Dispenser, With Doors or Drawers,  

Must Include Picture/Literature And 

Vinyl Color Selection With Bid                 

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-3                      

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______           

NO BID NO BID NO BID

WINCO  

#WIN857D    

715.00

NO BID

PROFEX  

#9027BRAD  

(4880519)    

483.11

(52033MB)    

412.25
NO BID
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NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

10.  Scale, Physician/School,           

Heavy-Duty Steel Lever, Lifetime      

Durability, With Height Rod,              

Pounds And Kilos Can Be Read       

From Either Side, Pivots And           

Bearings, 350lb. Capacity And 30" To 

78" Height Rod                                           

(Zenith High)                                           

Estimated Quantities-1                       

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______                                        

HEALTH-O-

METER  

#402KL    

169.95

#S80311    

243.46
NO BID

DETECTO  

#DET339     

163.75

NO BID

DETECTO  

#438   

(5458586)    

223.98

(74060)    

STATIONARY  

314.45

#339    173.00

11.  Stethoscope, Nurses,                

Lightweight, Streamlined, Excellent  

Acoustics, Red Tubing And Chest   

Piece                                                           

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                      

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______                                 

LITTMANN  

#2451         

(NO RED)      

SEE LIST ON 

BID           

34.95

#S1716G      

3.72
NO BID

AMERICAN  

DIAG.  

#ADC641R    

12.00

NO BID

DE BRAND  

#9795534      

2.76

(58055M)  

BLUE    5.90

#HH10-426-080 

10.00

12.  Stretcher, Portable,                    

Lightweight, Durable, With Web          

Straps                                                         

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

EVACU-AID  

72X28   28.50

OFFER        

#1G-058-58G   

531.14

NO BID NO BID NO BID

JUNKIN       

#SAF-603      

(3999283)      

183.72

(108000)   

165.75

#P170-C    

1,625.00

13.  Sundry Jars, Glass, Stainless    

Steel Covers, Imprinted, Includes    5 

Jars And Covers                                        

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                       

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

MABID  #812   

39.95

OFFER        

#1G-027546    

36.67

NO BID

GRAHAM 

FIELD        

#GF90-3454   

34.00

NO BID

TECH-MED  

#4010   

(1004641)    

26.92

(31108M)   

43.35

#HH39-802-000 

15.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:

BID# SDOC-05-091 KB                  

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

DATE/TIME: 05-10-05@11:00am           

HEALTH SUPPLIES & EQUIP FOR 

NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

14. Table, Exam, full cabinet model, with

two doors and adjustable shelves, nylon

coated stirrups, two lateral positions, 

full length adjustment, air-spring 

powered backrest, padded leg 

extension, basin shelf, paper cutter, 

paper dispenser, 54"L x  27"W x 30 

1/2"H (72" when expanded) Clinton 

Industries Model #8840 Or Equal, Must 

Include Picture/Literature And Vinyl 

Color Selection With Bid                           

(Alternative Education)                             

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

NO BID NO BID AS    745.85 AS   524.00 NO BID
AS  (1228953)  

582.74
NO BID NO BID

15.  Thermometer, Digital, Storage For 

25  Probe Covers, Automatic Probe 

Cover Ejection, Waterproof  Stainless 

Steel Probe, Large LCD Readout, 

Includes 3 "AAA"  Batteries, Warranty, 

Welch-Allyn Sure Temp 679 Or Equal     

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                      

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______                               

AS           

#690 T40-

01690         

183.50

OFFER        

#22-000-01    

53.19

AS   #90705   

234.30

AS           

#WA01690-200 

208.00

NO BID
AS   (2033856)  

186.22

AS  #690  

(47000)     

212.45

#01690-200    

208.00

16.  Utility Cart, Stainless Steel        

Angles, Rubber Tired Casters With   

Double Face Ball Bearings, 31"Hx   

27"Lx15"W                                                  

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______          

NO BID

OFFER        

#91-132       

11X24X38     

472.28

NO BID

BREWER  

#BRW63500   

145.00

NO BID

LAKESIDE  

#311   

(5220083)    

152.44

(23040)        

16-1/4X27-

3/4X32-1/8     

166.55

#311    141.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:

BID# SDOC-05-091 KB                  

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

DATE/TIME: 05-10-05@11:00am           

HEALTH SUPPLIES & EQUIP FOR 

NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

17.  Waste Can, Step-On, Red-Bio-  

Hazard, 16 Quart Capacity, Enamel  

Finish, Fire-Safe Construction,        

Stainless Steel Foot Pedal With Steel 

Liner                                                            

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______               

DETECTO     

#P-16-R       

85.90

OFFER        

#18-880A      

40.12

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(19116MR)     

5 GALLON     

55.20

NO BID

18.  Wheelchair, Adult, With Standard 

Footrest, Durable Vinyl Upholstery, 

Steel Bearings, Folding                             

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-2                              

Brand/Make and Model______                 

Unit Price______      

E & J  

#53000100 

VISTA II   

159.95

NO BID

#97000 

GUARDIAN 

EASY CARE 

2000          

208.20

INVACARE    

#IVC N51008   

116.00

NO BID

HENRY 

SCHEIN  

(1042177 / 

1044506)    

130.57

NO BID NO BID

19. Delivery time after receipt of 

purchase order                                          

_________days

20 DAYS 10-45 DAYS 10-14 DAYS 7-14 ARO NO BID

3-5 DAYS ARO 

STOCKED 

ITEMS   7-21 

DAYS 

EQUIPMENT  

PRICES ARE 

FOR DOCK TO 

DOCK 

DELIVERY

4-6 BUSINEES 

DAYS ARO

20 WORKING 

DAYS

20. Representatives name, address, 

phone and fax number:                             

__________________________________

__________________________________

________________Phone Number   

_________________Fax Number

YES YES YES YES NO BID  NO YES YES
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:

BID# SDOC-05-091 KB                  

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

DATE/TIME: 05-10-05@11:00am           

HEALTH SUPPLIES & EQUIP FOR 

NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

INVITATION TO

BID NOT 

COMPLETED

ORDERS 

UNDER $90.00 

ADD S/H $8.95



Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

PRICE SHEET

1.  Audiometer, AC Model, Screening 

And Threshold, Full Range of 

Frequencies And Intensity Levels, 

Welch Allyn #232 Or Equal (Zenith High)

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

2. Blood Pressure Monitor, Digital, 

Manual Inflating, 16mm Digital Display, 

Audible Tone Indicates Proper Inflation 

Level, Medium Cuff, Instruction Guide, 

With Case A & D Engineering, Inc. #UA-

702H Or Equal                                            

(1 for Bellalago Middle)                             

(1 for Zenith High)                                      

Estimated Quantities-2                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

3. Dispenser, Alcohol, 8 oz, Plastic, 

Push Top                                                    

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

TABULATION SHEET FOR:

BID# SDOC-05-091 KB                  

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

DATE/TIME: 05-10-05@11:00am           

HEALTH SUPPLIES & EQUIP FOR 

NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   
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NOT SIGNED YES

YES YES

AS   1,000.00 AS   998.00

Items #2, 9 & 

15:  Lowest bid 

did not meet 

specifications, 

awarded to 2nd 

lowest bid

OMRON       

#HEM-432C  

(1674)        

50.00

OMRON  

#432C    36.69

Item #4:  

Lowest bid was 

for a chart only, 

not the eye 

exam cabinet

#908   6.00

SCHOOL 

HEALTH  

#90009   7.49

Item #6:  

Lowest bid was 

for the light bult, 

not the exam 

lamp



TABULATION SHEET FOR:

BID# SDOC-05-091 KB                  

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

DATE/TIME: 05-10-05@11:00am           

HEALTH SUPPLIES & EQUIP FOR 

NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

4.  Eye Test Cabinet, Illuminated,     

Durable metal, 2 non-glare Translucent 

eye charts:  Standard    Snell And 

Illiterate "E" type,                                       

Includes Standard 8W Fluorescent          

Daylight Bulb, Portable Or Permanent 

Mount, 11"x22"                                          

To Include Standard Snell                        

Red And Green Charts Snell or Equal     

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______                                        

5.  First Aid Kit, 25 Person, Rust      

Resistant 24 Gauge Steel Case, List Of 

Contents Are To Be Included With Bid,   

Johnson & Johnson Or Equal                  

(Zenith High)                                         

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

6.  Magnifying Lamp, Clear                

Magnified Illuminated View,                      

5" Double Convex, Clear Optical Glass, 

3-Diopter Lens, 22 Watt                             

Fluorescent Bulb, 1.75X                            

Magnification, 41" Arm, With             

Caster Base, White                                    

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______
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NO BID NO BID

NO BID
AS  #42017    

29.98

BRANDT   

325.00

DAZOR  

#24057    

279.00
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DATE/TIME: 05-10-05@11:00am           

HEALTH SUPPLIES & EQUIP FOR 

NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

7.  Narcotic Cabinet, Single Door,   

Double Lock, 30"W x 30"Hx12"D             

18 Gauge Steel Exterior, 1 Fixed       

Shelf, 1 Adjustable Shelf, Includes   

Mounting Hardware, White or Beige        

(Zenith High)                                       

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

8. Panels, Privacy, mobile, each panel 

27" W, 3-panels, folding, 1" round 

tubular steel frame, flame-retardant, 

bacteriastatic, white vinyl, has four 2" 

twin-wheel casters, 69" H                 

Estimated Quantities-2                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

9.  Recovery Couches, With Base,   

Adjustable Back Rest, Paper Roll     

Dispenser, With Doors or Drawers,  

Must Include Picture/Literature And 

Vinyl Color Selection With Bid                 

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-3                      

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______           
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OSI   

24WX10DX30H 

225.00

LAKESIDE  

#24123    2 ADJ 

SHELVES   

149.00

WINCO  #6133  

130.00

PRESCO  

#14001   68"H  

129.00

CLINTON  

#3813    550.00

WMC  #24270  

569.00
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NEW SCHOOL ADDITIONS

READ BY:   Kathy Brown     __

RECORDED BY:    Lisa Kesecker   

10.  Scale, Physician/School,           

Heavy-Duty Steel Lever, Lifetime      

Durability, With Height Rod,              

Pounds And Kilos Can Be Read       

From Either Side, Pivots And           

Bearings, 350lb. Capacity And 30" To 

78" Height Rod                                           

(Zenith High)                                           

Estimated Quantities-1                       

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______                                        

11.  Stethoscope, Nurses,                

Lightweight, Streamlined, Excellent  

Acoustics, Red Tubing And Chest   

Piece                                                           

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                      

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______                                 

12.  Stretcher, Portable,                    

Lightweight, Durable, With Web          

Straps                                                         

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______

13.  Sundry Jars, Glass, Stainless    

Steel Covers, Imprinted, Includes    5 

Jars And Covers                                        

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                       

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______
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HEALTH-O-

METER  

PELSTAR      

#2364         

250.00

HEALTH O 

METER  

#58008     

249.00

ADC  #6300    

5.00

SCHOOL 

HEALTH       

#5710S        

3.79

NO BID

SCHOOL 

HEALTH  

#S9007        

339.95

#924     35.00

SCHOOL 

HEALTH  

#46008        

35.95
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14. Table, Exam, full cabinet model, with

two doors and adjustable shelves, nylon

coated stirrups, two lateral positions, 

full length adjustment, air-spring 

powered backrest, padded leg 

extension, basin shelf, paper cutter, 

paper dispenser, 54"L x  27"W x 30 

1/2"H (72" when expanded) Clinton 

Industries Model #8840 Or Equal, Must 

Include Picture/Literature And Vinyl 

Color Selection With Bid                           

(Alternative Education)                             

Estimated Quantities-1                              

Brand/Make And Model ______                

Unit Price______      

15.  Thermometer, Digital, Storage For 

25  Probe Covers, Automatic Probe 

Cover Ejection, Waterproof  Stainless 

Steel Probe, Large LCD Readout, 

Includes 3 "AAA"  Batteries, Warranty, 

Welch-Allyn Sure Temp 679 Or Equal     

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                      

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______                               

16.  Utility Cart, Stainless Steel        

Angles, Rubber Tired Casters With   

Double Face Ball Bearings, 31"Hx   

27"Lx15"W                                                  

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______          

N
a
ti
o
n
a
l 
H

e
a
lt
h
 S

u
p
p
ly

  
  
  
  
  
  
  

2
0
9
3
 W

a
n
ta

g
h
 A

v
e
n
u
e
  
  
  
  
  
  
  

W
a
n
ta

g
h
, 
N

y
 1

1
7
9
3

S
p
o
rt

s
 H

e
a
lt
h
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
 

D
iv

is
io

n
 o

f 
S

c
h
o
o
l 
H

e
a
lt
h
 C

o
rp

  

1
3
5
0
0
 S

u
tt
o
n
 P

a
rk

 D
r.

 S
. 
  
  
  
  
  

S
u
it
e
 6

0
1
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
 

J
a
c
k
s
o
n
v
ill

e
, 
F

L
 3

2
2
2
4

AS   650.00 NO BID

AS    #690    

225.00

AS   #690     

169.00

NO BID

SCHOOL 

HEALTH  

#2401C     

16WX27DX33H 

174.98
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17.  Waste Can, Step-On, Red-Bio-  

Hazard, 16 Quart Capacity, Enamel  

Finish, Fire-Safe Construction,        

Stainless Steel Foot Pedal With Steel 

Liner                                                            

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-1                     

Brand/Make And Model______                 

Unit Price______               

18.  Wheelchair, Adult, With Standard 

Footrest, Durable Vinyl Upholstery, 

Steel Bearings, Folding                             

(Zenith High)                                              

Estimated Quantities-2                              

Brand/Make and Model______                 

Unit Price______      

19. Delivery time after receipt of 

purchase order                                          

_________days

20. Representatives name, address, 

phone and fax number:                             

__________________________________

__________________________________

________________Phone Number   

_________________Fax Number
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NO BID NO BID

E & J VISTA   

210.00

SCHOOL 

HEALTH  

#10022    

179.00

5-7 DAYS 7-21 DAYS

YES YES
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