
Bid Project: Plumbing Parts and Supplies
Bid Project # : 007-09-10

Effective Date:

Expiration Date: Renews Annually

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

Vendors: Apple Specialties Ferguson Enterprise H2O Supply Inc. Heritage Food Service Equipment Marks Plumbing Parts

2042 N. Country Road 512 E Dallas Road, Ste 100 2324 N. IH-35E 5130 Executive Blvd. PO Box 121554

Wading River, NY 11792 Grapevine, TX 76051 Carrollton, TX  75006 Fort Wayne, IN 46808-1149 Fort Worth, TX  76121-1554

Phone # : 631-886-2160 817-442-0442 972-242-2289 800-458-5593 Ext. 7602 817-731-6211

Fax # : 631-8862161 817-442-0338 972-242-4648 800-800-4981 817-244-6275

Account Rep: James Tilton Bill Jenkins Jay Katz Linda Maynard Lee Hickey/Glen Ford

Acct Rep Phone # : Same as Above Same As Above Same As Above Same As Above 817-675-3467

Email: Not Provided bill.jenkins@ferguson.com jlk@h2osupply.net lindam@hfse.com lee@markspp.com

Agree to EPCNT 

Agreement: Yes No

Yes --  delivery charges might 

apply; terms of sale if not open 

acct. status Yes Yes

Store Hours and Will Call 

Counter: N/A

6:30am-5pm - Monday thru 

Friday. YES - Counter Service 

open same hours

7am-5pm - Monday thru Friday. YES -

Counter Service open same hours 8am-5pm - Monday thru Friday

7am-5:30pm - Monday thru 

Friday. YES - Counter Service 

open same hours

Emergency # : N/A None

After Hours Message Service - Call 

972.242.2289 None None

Discounts:

35-49%  Depending on 

Manufacturer 35%  Store Discount 40-50% Varies 

Prices shown are net, all 

discounts applied.  Store Discount 

20%

Minimum $: None None $10 None $10

Damage Claim: 2 Days after receipt of order 1 Day after receipt of order At time of delivery;  receipt of material 24 hours from receipt of material 30 days

Shipping Cost: None Store Pick-Up Only

Special order material or request of 

RUSH delivery is subject to shipping 

charges Included in Price FOB Destination None

Website: None www.ferguson.com www.h2oSupply.net www.hfse.com www.markspp.com

Catalog Updates: Approximately every 2 years N/A Check Website - Updated Randomly Check Website Unscheduled

Manufacturers: Catalog and Price List Supplied List Provided Catalog Supplied Check Website Price List Supplied

January 31, 2015

February 1, 2010

1/21/2010



Bid Project: Plumbing Parts and Supplies
Bid Project # : 007-09-10

Effective Date:

Expiration Date: Renews AnnuallyJanuary 31, 2015

February 1, 2010

VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

Vendors: Morrison Supply Co. TMS South Winston Water Cooler, Ltd.

311 East Vickery Blvd. 4155 West Bellfort 5014 Mark IV Pkwy

Fort Worth, TX 76014 Houston, TX 77025 Fort Worth, TX 76106

Phone # : 817-201-9055 800-392-5066 817-624-9090

Fax # : 817-877-0721 800-342-0559 817-624-1747

Account Rep: Andrew Hughes Mike Ritter Sue Waller

Acct Rep Phone # : Same as Above 800-392-5066 Same As Above

Email: ahughes@morsco.com miker@tmssouth.com swaller@winstonwatercooler.com

Agree to EPCNT 

Agreement: Yes Yes Yes

Store Hours and Will Call 

Counter: 7am-5pm - Monday thru Friday N/A 7am-5pm - Monday thru Friday

Emergency # : None None None

Discounts: 0 to 75%  per Manufacturer

Varies - Call or email for Price 

Quote Varies by Manufacturer

Minimum $: No minimum is required $25 No minimum is required

Damage Claim: 1 to 30 Days Receipt of Material 24 hours after receipt of material

Shipping Cost: Free

Orders Over $200 FOB 

Destination; Under $200 freight is 

pre-paid and added to the 

invoice.

No delivery cost unless noted on 

customer's quotation

Website: www.morsco.com www.tmssouth.com www.winstonwatercooler.com

Catalog Updates: Manufacturer Determines On-Line Catalog On-Line Catalog

Manufacturers: See Website See Website See Website

DM

Facility Services will have the option, each time they make a purchase, to choose from one of these vendors that will offer the best 

value for their specific needs.

1/21/2010



Grapevine-Colleyville ISD

CSP #007-09-10

Plumbing Parts and Supplies

Part One Tabulation Form

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Sloan A-163-A Each $1.19 $178.50 Sloan B-50-A Each $1.66 $249.00

Ferguson Enterprise Sloan A-163-A Each $3.15 $472.50 Sloan B-50-A Each $2.89 $433.50

H2O Supply Zurn P6000EGR Each $1.68 $252.00 Zurn** P6000MK Each $1.09 $163.50

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Sloan 06212 Each $3.00 $450.00 Sloan 06258 Each $2.25 $337.50

Morrison Supply Company Sloan A-163-A Each $2.64 $396.00 Sloan B-51-A Each $3.46 $519.00

TMS South Sloan 40201004 Each $0.90 $135.00 Sloan 40262305 Each $1.42 $213.00

Winston Water Cooler Sloan A-163-A Each $2.81 $421.50 Sloan B-50-A Each $2.18 $327.00

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Sloan V-500-A Each $1.35 $202.50 Sloan A-156-AA Each $4.89 $978.00

Ferguson Enterprise Sloan V-551-A Each $2.59 $388.50 Sloan A-156-AA Each $8.06 $1,612.00

H2O Supply Zurn** P6000B Each $1.09 $163.50 Zurn P6000EER Each $4.92 $984.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Sloan 06215 Each $2.33 $349.50 Sloan 06220 Each $7.49 $1,498.00

Morrison Supply Company Sloan V-551-A Each $1.59 $238.50 Sloan A-156-AA Each $7.36 $1,472.00

TMS South Sloan 40201005 Each $1.14 $171.00 Sloan 40260009 Each $4.44 $888.00

Winston Water Cooler Sloan V-551-A Each $1.94 $291.00 Sloan A-156-AA Each $7.19 $1,438.00

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Sloan A-71 Each $1.25 $125.00 Sloan A-19-AC Each $2.12 $212.00

Ferguson Enterprise Sloan A-71 Each $4.94 $494.00 Sloan A-19-AC Each $3.87 $387.00

H2O Supply Zurn** P6000L Each $1.09 $109.00 Zurn** P6000E43 Each $1.68 $168.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Sloan 06207 Each $4.58 $458.00 Sloan 06208 Each $3.58 $358.00

Morrison Supply Company Sloan A-71 Each $3.84 $384.00 Sloan A-19-AC Each $2.98 $298.00

TMS South Sloan 40261124 Each $1.28 $128.00 Sloan 40261129 Each $1.96 $196.00

Winston Water Cooler Sloan A-71 Each $4.41 $441.00 Sloan A-19-AC Each $3.45 $345.00

Part - Item #1 - Guide Assembly (Qty 150) Part - Item #2 - Handle Repair Kit (Qty 150)

Part - Item #3 - Vacuum Breaker Kit (Qty 150) Part - Item #4 - Diaphragm Kit (QTY 200)

Part - Item #5 - Plastic Inside Cover (Qty 100) Part - Item #6 - White Relief Valve (Qty 100)
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Grapevine-Colleyville ISD

CSP #007-09-10

Plumbing Parts and Supplies

Part One Tabulation Form

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Sloan A-19-AU Each $2.12 $212.00 Sloan H-533 Each $0.14 $28.00

Ferguson Enterprise Sloan A-19-AV Each $7.55 $755.00 Sloan H-533 Each $0.62 $124.00

H2O Supply Zurn** P6000E413 Each $1.68 $168.00 Zurn C31 Each $0.30 $60.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Sloan 06209 Each $3.58 $358.00 Sloan 00642 Each $0.19 $38.00

Morrison Supply Company Sloan A-19-AV Each $3.00 $300.00 Sloan H-553 Each $0.57 $114.00

TMS South Sloan 40260415 Each $1.92 $192.00 Sloan 40950069 Each $0.03 $6.00

Winston Water Cooler Sloan A-19-AU Each $3.45 $345.00 Sloan H-553 Each $0.55 $110.00

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Sloan H-543-ASD Each $4.36 $348.80 Sloan H-541-ASD Each $4.36 $348.80

Ferguson Enterprise NO BID NO BID

H2O Supply Zurn PS6003PSD Each $6.00 $480.00 Zurn** P6000DSD Each $2.25 $180.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Sloan 06331 Each $6.66 $532.80 Sloan 06330 Each $6.66 $532.80

Morrison Supply Company Sloan H-543-AA Each $5.52 $441.60 Sloan H-541-AA Each $5.52 $441.60

TMS South Sloan 40261085 Each $3.11 $248.80 Sloan 40201009 Each $3.98 $318.40

Winston Water Cooler Sloan H-543-ASD Each $6.38 $510.40 Sloan H-541-ASD Each $6.38 $510.40

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Sloan F-5-A Each $7.75 $620.00 Sloan F-5-A Each $7.75 $620.00

Ferguson Enterprise Sloan F54A Each $9.65 $772.00 Sloan F56A Each $9.65 $772.00

H2O Supply Zurn** P6003H Each $6.00 $480.00 Zurn** P6000H Each $6.00 $480.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Sloan 06285 Each $11.40 $912.00 Sloan 06287 Each $11.40 $912.00

Morrison Supply Company Sloan F-5-A Each $7.46 $596.80 Sloan F-5-A Each $7.46 $596.80

TMS South Sloan 40266125 Each $7.44 $595.20 Sloan 40266146 Each $7.44 $595.20

Winston Water Cooler Sloan F-5-A-3/4 Each $8.61 $688.80 Sloan F-5-A-1-1/2 Each $8.61 $688.80

Part - Item #10 - 1" Stop Repair Kit (Qty 80)

Part - Item #11 - 3/4" Spud Coupling Kit (Qty 80) Part - Item #12 - 1-1/2" Spud Coupling Kit (Qty 80)

Part - Item #7 - Black Relief Valve (Qty 100) Part - Item #8 - #42 O-Ring (Qty 200)

Part - Item #9 - 3/4" Stop Repair Kit (Qty 80)
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Grapevine-Colleyville ISD

CSP #007-09-10

Plumbing Parts and Supplies

Part One Tabulation Form

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Plumbest C27-150 Each $4.98 $398.40 Plumbest C27-134 Each $3.99 $319.20

Ferguson Enterprise Pro-Flo PF103 Each $6.71 $536.80 Pro-Flo PF105 Each $5.47 $437.60

H2O Supply Eastman 40135 Each $3.39 $271.20 Eastman 40131 Each $2.25 $180.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Mark's 09206 Each $2.98 $238.40 Mark's 09208 Each $1.69 $135.20

Morrison Supply Company NO BID Plumbest C27-134 Each $3.83 $306.40

TMS South TMS 40210959 Each $2.38 $190.40 TMS 40210961 Each $1.42 $113.60

Winston Water Cooler Gene Rich 112BCS Each $6.09 $487.20 Gene Rich 34BUS Each $3.71 $296.80

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Chicago Faucet 671-XJKNF Each $19.37 $1,549.60 Chicago Faucet 665-190 KJKNF Each $11.71 $936.80

Ferguson Enterprise Chicago Faucet 671-XJKNF Each $23.76 $1,900.80 NO BID

H2O Supply Chicago Faucet 671-XJKNF Each $25.10 $2,008.00 Chicago Faucet 665-190 KJKNF Each $15.85 $1,268.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Chicago Faucet 11175 Each $22.68 $1,814.40 Chicago Faucet 11174 Each $19.70 $1,576.00

Morrison Supply Company Chicago Faucet 671-XJKNF Each $21.75 $1,740.00 Chicago Faucet 665-190 KJKNF Each $13.15 $1,052.00

TMS South Chicago Faucet 40120051 Each $17.00 $1,360.00 Chicago Faucet 40120646 Each $24.07 $1,925.60

Winston Water Cooler Chicago Faucet 671-XJKNF Each $25.66 $2,052.80 Chicago Faucet 665-190 KJKNF Each $15.70 $1,256.00

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Plumbest G13-002 Each $1.92 $153.60 Plumbest C03-300 Each $1.49 $149.00

Ferguson Enterprise Pro-Flo PFWRWH Each $1.55 $124.00 NO BID

H2O Supply Oatey BWD Each $0.68 $54.40 Oatey 31187 Each $2.69 $269.00

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID NO BID

Mark's Plumbing Parts Harvey 13594 Each $2.80 $224.00 Mark's 09195 Each $1.13 $113.00

Morrison Supply Company Morrison MS4410 Each $1.09 $87.20 Morrison MS4480 Each $4.54 $454.00

TMS South TMS 401211330 Each $1.59 $127.20 TMS 40210041 Each $0.47 $47.00

Winston Water Cooler Oatey BWNS Each $0.94 $75.20 Gene Rich W329 Each $1.64 $164.00

Part - Item #15 - Lower Cartridge Unit (Qty 80) Part - Item #16 - Actuator (Qty 80)

Part - Item #17 - Wax Gasket (Qty 80) Part - Item #18 - Close Couple Gasket (Qty 100)

Part - Item #13 - 1-1/2" Spud Assembly (Qty 80) Part - Item #14 - 1"X3/4" Spud Assembly (Qty 80)
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Grapevine-Colleyville ISD

CSP #007-09-10

Plumbing Parts and Supplies

Part One Tabulation Form

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Apple Specialties Plumbest G13-005 Each $2.75 $275.00 Elkay 61314C Each $11.82 $886.50

Ferguson Enterprise NO BID Elkay 61314C Each $12.81 $960.75

H2O Supply NO BID Elkay 61314C Each $12.85 $963.75

Heritage Food Service Equip. NO BID Elkay 61314C Each $12.12 $909.00

Mark's Plumbing Parts Mark's 24042 Each $1.92 $192.00 Elkay (60290C) 02402 Each $11.42 $856.50

Morrison Supply Company SJ G13534 Each $2.37 $237.00 Elkay 61314C Each $10.94 $820.50

TMS South TMS 4145170 Each $1.43 $143.00 Elkay 40700150 Each $4.47 $335.25

Winston Water Cooler EZ-FLO G13-534 Each $2.46 $246.00 Halsey-Taylor 61314C Each $17.73 $1,329.75

Vendor Proposed Mfg. Vendor's Part # UOM Unit Price Extended Price

Recommendation 

is to Award by 

Item

Apple Specialties Elkay 50986C Each $6.24 $468.00 $1,061.80

Ferguson Enterprise Elkay 50986C Each $6.76 $507.00

H2O Supply Elkay 50986C Each $5.95 $446.25 $54.40

Heritage Food Service Equip. Elkay 50986C Each $6.40 $480.00

Mark's Plumbing Parts Elkay 22184 Each $15.77 $1,182.75

Morrison Supply Company Elkay 50986C Each $5.78 $433.50 $433.50

TMS South Elkay 40700167 Each $7.75 $581.25 $5,745.85

Winston Water Cooler Halsey-Taylor 50986C Each $9.36 $702.00

$7,297.55

**Most valves in the District are Sloan.  The District prefers to utilitze the same manuafacturer repair part as the specific assembly manufacturer.

Part - Item #21 - Elkay Regulator Housing (Qty 75) Approximate Annual Cost Based on Estimated Quantities

Part - Item #19 - Closet Cushion (Qty 100) Part - Item #20 - Elkay Fountain Cartridge (Regulator) (Qty 75)

$8,509.90

$13,068.85

$10,928.90

Awarded to a Single Vendor for All 

Items Awarded by Item

$9,258.70 $1,061.80

ANNUAL TOTAL COMPARISON:

$54.40

$8,509.90 $7,297.55

$433.50

$5,747.85
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